




2231/Mkg(Civil)/2024
1 Name of the Firm
2 Address details

3 Contact No & Email ID

4 GST No.

S.No Qty Description of work Unit Rate (in words & figures) Amount

1 4.50 
Dismantling, clearing away and carefully stacking materials
useful for re-use for any thickness of walls - Brick / Stone
Masonry in cement mortar walls under 3m high.

Cum

2 4.50 

Brick work in Cement Mortar 1:5 (one part cement and five parts
m-sand) using best quality II class table moulded chamber burnt
bricks of size 9" x 4-1/2" x 3" to line, level and to plumb on one
face including necessary scaffolding, racking out joints, curing
etc., complete as directed by the departmental officer and as per
standard specification.

Cum

3 1.00 

Reinforced Cement Concrete 1:2:4 (One Cement, Two sand and
Four hard broken stonjelly) using 20 mm gauge hard broken
granite stone jelly for all RCC items of works excluding cost of
reinforcement grill and fabricating charges, centering and
shuttering but including laying, vibrating with mechanical
vibrators, finishing, curing, etc. and providing fixtures like fan
clamps in the RCC floor / roof slabs wherever necessary and
bearing surfaces of walls, beams etc. shall be finished smooth 

Cum

4 9.00 

Supplying and erecting centering for sides and soffits including
necessary supports and strutting upto 3.29 M height for plane
surfaces as detailed below in all floors with all cross bracings
using Mild Steel sheets of size 90 x 60 cm and 10 BG stiffened
with welded Mild Steel angle of size 25mm x 25mm x 3 mm for
boarding laid over silver oak joists of size 10cm x 6.50 cm spaced
at abote 90 cm centre to centre and supported by casurina props 

Sqm

5 1.00

Supplying, fabricating and placing in position Mild Steel /
Ribbed Tor Steel grills for all RCC works as per design given
including cost of steel and G.I. binding wire in all floors etc.
complete complying with standard specification.

Qtl

6 43.00

Plastering with Cement Mortar 1:5 (One cement and Five m-
sand), 12mm thick in all floors including scaffolding neatly
finishing, curing etc. complete complying with standard
specification and as directed by the departmental officers.

Sqm

7 175.00
Supply and fabrication of MS tubular section including the cost
of all to site and all labour charges and as per standard
specifications etc complete.

Kg

8 90.00

Painting two coats of old wall surface with ready mixed plastic
emulsion paint (exterior) of first class quality and of approved
colour including scaffolding etc., complete as directed by the
departmental officials.

Sqm

9 40.00

Painting two coats over iron works such as steel doors, windows,
ventilators, window bar balustrades etc., with best approved first 
quality synthetic enamel paint of approved colour in all floors.
The rate is inclusive of all materials, brushes and scaffolding
charges etc., complete complying with standard specification

Sqm

10 1.00

Supplying and fixing in position best quality stainless steel sink
of following sizes including cost of 32mm dia CP waste
coupling, 32mm dia PVC waste pipe with rubber plug and
chain, 15mm dia brass nipple including fixing the sink in
position and testing for leakages etc., complete complying with
standard specifications excluding CI brackets

No

TAMILNADU COOPERATIVE MILK PRODUCERS’ FEDERATION LIMITED,
Marketing Unit, Aavin Illam, 3-A, Pasumpon Muthuramalingam Salai, Nandanam, Chennai-600035.

Price Schedule
Ref .No

Name of work : Repair works to the damaged compound wall and glass door repair works  in MMDA Hitech parlour, Arumbakkam



11 1.60

Solid PVC Door Shutters using 19 Gauge 19mm MS square tubes
for styles and outer frames. 15mm MS square tubes for top, lock
and bottom rails. The steel tubes shall be covered with 5mm
thick solid PVC Sheets. Shutter using 5mm thick solid PVC
Sheets for panelling shall rigidly fixed in position including
necessary furniture and fittings. The over all size of styles shall
be 50mm x 30mm etc complete

Sqm

12 1.00

Supply & fixing of Heavy duty 100 kg floor spring with 90
degree hold open feature and service charges for removing and
refixing of new floor spring and service charges for civil work for
removing and refixing of ACP sheet etc complete

Job

13 4.00
Conveyance charges for removal of tree debris and other
unwanted materials in and around the parlour etc complete as
directed

Load

Sub - Total

GST 18%

Grand Total

Signature of the Offerer


